

REGULAR MEETING
SACRAMENTO CITY COUNCIL
DECEMBER 27, 1962

The Honorable City Council met in regular session on this date at the hour of 7:50 o'clock P.M., President Pro-Tem Christensen presiding and roll call was answered as follows:

Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

The City Clerk reported having furnished each member with a copy of proceedings of previous meeting. The Minutes of Regular Meeting of December 20, 1962, were ordered approved.

The following bids were received and referred to the City Manager for a report:

Various Types of Asphalt

Item No. I: Emulsified Asphalt (Cationic, Rapid Setting Type) F.O.B. Job Site
For Delivery Only: Free time allowed for unloading:
Rate per hour (prorated) for demurrage after expiration of free unloading time:
For Delivery and Spreading: Free time allowed for unloading:
Rate per hour (prorated) for demurrage after expiration of free unloading time:
Spreading, price per ton:

Item NO. II: Penetration Type Emulsified Asphalt: (F.O.B. Job Site)
For Delivery Only: Free time allowed for unloading:
Rate per hour (prorated) for demurrage after expiration of free unloading time:
For Delivery and Spreading: Free time allowed for unloading:
Rate per hour (prorated) for demurrage after expiration of free unloading time:
Spreading, price per ton:

Item No. III: Steam Refined Paving Asphalt:

F.O.B. Bidder's Plant, located at:

Item NO. IV: Penetration Type Emulsified Asphalt:

F.O.B. Bidder's Plant, located at:

	Union Oil Company of California 76 Broadway Sacramento, California	Douglas Oil Company of California 4302 Madison North Highlands, California	Shell Oil Company 100 Bush Street San Francisco, California
	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton
Item No. I:	\$ 27.40	\$ 27.40	\$ 28.60
For Delivery Only:			
Free Time:	1 1/2 hour	1 1/2 hour	1 1/2 hour
Rate Per Hour (prorated) for demurrage:	\$ 7.75 per hour	\$ 7.75 per hour	\$ 7.75 per hour
For Delivery & Spreading:			
Free Time:	2 hours	2 hours	2 hours
Rate Per Hour (prorated) for demurrage:	\$ 9.25 per hour	\$ 9.25 per hour	\$ 9.25 per hour
Spreading, price per ton:	\$ 1.30	\$ 1.30	\$ 1.30
Item No. II:			
For Delivery Only:			
Free Time:	1 1/2 hour	1 1/2 hour	1 1/2 hour
Rate Per Hour (prorated) for demurrage:	\$ 7.75 per hour	\$ 7.75 per hour	\$ 7.75 per hour
For Delivery & Spreading:			
Free Time:			
Rate Per Hour (prorated) for demurrage:	\$ 9.25	\$ 9.25	\$ 9.25
Spreading, price per ton:	\$ 1.30	\$ 1.30	\$ 1.30
Item III:	No Bid	\$ 31.70	\$ 28.00
F.O.B. Bidder's Plant:		1515 - 65th Street	Fair Oaks, California
Item IV:	No Bid	\$ 1.36 per gallon	\$ 0.1208 per gallon
F.O.B. Bidder's Plant:		1515 - 65th Street	Fair Oaks, California
Bidder's Federal Social Security I.D.No.:	95-1315-450	54-2124734	13-1299890
Bid Deposit:	No Bid Deposit	5% Bid Bond	\$1200.00 Bid Bond

	American Bitumuls & Asphalt Co. 4525 San Leandro St. Oakland 1, California	A. Teichert & Son, Inc. 191 Stockton Boulevard Sacramento, California
	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton
Item No. I:	\$ 27.40	\$ No Bid
For Delivery Only:		
Free Time:	1 1/2 hours	
Rate Per Hour (prorated) for demurrage:	\$ 7.75	
For Delivery & Spreading:		
Free Time:	2 hours	
Rate Per Hour (prorated) for demurrage:	\$ 9.25	
Spreading, price per Ton:	\$ 1.30	

2426

Item No. II: \$28.60**** No Bid
 For Delivery Only:
 Free Time: 1½ hours
 R Rate Per Hour (prorated) for demurrage: \$7.75
 For Delivery & Spreading
 Free Time: 2 hours
 Rate Per Hour (prorated) for demurrage: \$9.25
 Spreading, price per ton: \$1.30
 Item III: \$21.50 No Bid
 F.O.B. Bidder's Plant: Richmond, California
 Item IV: \$0.0938 per gal. \$0.136
 F.O.B. Bidder's Plant: Oakland, California Perkins Plant, Jackson Rd. 5.39 miles
 Bidder's Federal Social Security Identification No. 94-0279270 94-0919260
 Bid Deposit: \$1,500.00 Cert. Ck. 10% Bid Bond

****Refer to letter from American Bitumuls & Asphalt Company dated December 27, 1962".....The price quoted for Item II Penetration Type Emulsified Asphalt, F.O.B. Job Site was in error. The price per ton should be \$26.20 instead of \$28.60 as shown on the original proposal."

Street Paving Materials (Screenings, Aggregate Base, Asphaltic Concrete & Cutback Mixture)

Item I: 1/4" x No. 10 Crushed Gravel Screenings
 3/8" x No. 6 Crushed Gravel Screenings
 Item II: 1½" Aggregate Base Class 2
 Location of Plant (Item I and II)
 Distance from plant to base point, 32nd & S Streets
 Item III: 1/2" Maximum Asphaltic Concrete
 3/4" Maximum Asphaltic Concrete
 Item IV: 1/2" Maximum Cutback Mixture
 Location of Plants (Items III and IV)
 Distance from plant to base point, 32nd & S Streets

	A. Teichert & Son, Inc. 1931 Stockton Boulevard Sacramento, California	Granite Construction Co. P.O.Box 900 Watsonville, California	Waldon Aggregates 7609 - 14th Avenue Sacramento, California
	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton
Item I:	\$ 1.85	\$ 2.10	\$ 2.10
	1.85	2.10	2.05
Item II:	1.23	1.15	1.20
	Perkins Plant, Jackson Road 5.39 miles	14th Avenue & Power Inn Road 4.8 miles	7609 - 14th Avenue 4.12 miles
Item III:	3.74	3.85	4.60
	3.74	3.75	4.50
Item IV:	4.15	4.50	4.75
	Perkins Plant, Jackson Road 5.39 miles	14th Avenue & Power Inn Road 4.8 miles	7601 - 14th Avenue 4.12 miles
Discount for Cash:	None	Net	Net
Bidder's Federal Social Security ID. No.	94-0910260	94-1509552	94-1210149
Bid Deposit:	10% Bid Bond	5% Bid Bond	5% Bid Bond

2427

Brighton Sand & Gravel Co.
 P.O.Box 7001
 Sacramento 26, California
Price Per Ton
 Item I;
 Item II: \$1.30
 Jackson & Manlove Roads
 4 miles
 Item III: \$4.70
 \$4.70
 Item IV: \$4.70
 Jackson & Manlove Roads
 4 miles
 Discount for cash: ten percent (10%) thirty days
 Bidder's Federal Social Security ID No. 941104018
 Bid Deposit: 1 5% Bid Bond

This having been the date set for property owners protest hearing on the proposed annexation of the "Bannon Street Annexation Area" the matter was heard at this time.

There being no written protests filed and no citizens in the audience desiring to speak on the matter, Councilman Mering moved that the hearing be closed and the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 371

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO:

That the City Council has examined the property owners' protests heretofore filed against BANNON STREET ANNEXATION AREA as to the number and value of property represented thereby and finds and declares that said protests do not constitute a majority protest to the annexation as set forth in Section 35121.1 of the Government Code of California.

2428

Seconded by Councilman Marriott and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT; Councilman McKinney.

Councilman Mering thereupon moved presented and moved adoption of the following resolution calling a Special Municipal Election for Tuesday, February 26, 1963, on the question of annexation of the "Bannon Street Annexation Area" :

RESOLUTION NO. 372

RESOLUTION ORDERING, PROCLAIMING, CALLING, GIVING NOTICE OF, AND PROVIDING FOR THE HOLDING OF A SPECIAL ELECTION FOR THE PURPOSE OF SUBMITTING TO THE ELECTORS RESIDING IN THE TERRITORY HEREINAFTER PARTICULARLY DESCRIBED AND COMMONLY KNOWN AS "BANNON STREET ANNEXATION AREA," THE QUESTION OF WHETHER SUCH TERRITORY SHALL BE ANNEXED TO, INCORPORATED IN AND MADE A PART OF SAID CITY OF SACRAMENTO. (REFERENCE IS HEREBY MADE TO ORIGINAL RESOLUTION ADOPTED ON THIS DATE AND SET OUT IN FULL IN RESOLUTION RECORD 1962 ON FILE IN OFFICE OF THE CITY CLERK).

2429

Seconded by Councilman Marriott and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

The City Manager verbally reported that the police arrest frequency rate in the Gardenland-Del Paso Heights-Robla Annexed Area for the period November through December 25th, 1962, is below the amount as was anticipated.

This having been the date set for hearing and no protests having been received, the City Manager presented and Councilman Marriott moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION ORDERING WORK NO. 3634

2430

Resolution ordering work, which calls for bids to be received on date of January 17, 1963, in the matter of the improvement of Ways, Court, Drives and Rights of Way within and adjacent to Valley Hi Units No. 1 and 2 Assessment District. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1962 on file in office of the City Clerk).

Seconded by Councilman Talkin and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

Having been continued from the Regular Meeting of December 20, 1962, the proposed amendment to Section 42.8 of the City Code "limiting the number of taxicabs permitted to operate in the City" was heard and discussed at this time.

Communications from Joint Council of Teamsters # 38 and Teamsters Automotive Chauffeurs, Laundry and Dry Cleaners Drivers Local Union 165, endorsing the proposed amendment, were read and ordered filed.

Kneeland H. Lobner, Attorney representing several taxicab companies, appeared and urged the Council to approve the proposed amendment.

2431

Francis Dillon, Attorney representing the Greyhound Taxicab Company, appeared and protested said proposed amendment and requested the Council to appoint a three man fact finding committee to study the proposal.

Mr. Dan Milonich, representing the Taxidrivers Union appeared and suggested the committee take into account the number of permits and how they would be distributed.

Mr. Fred Garner of 613 Kischner Avenue, Del Paso Heights, a cab driver, addressed the Council stating he was against reducing the number of permits allowed.

December 27, 1962

Mr. Jim Smith, organizer for the Joint Council of Teamsters #38, appeared and advised the Council that they were supporting the proposed amendment.

Following further discussion, Councilman Domich moved that the matter be referred to Committee for study and return with facts for Council consideration. Seconded by Councilman Mering and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

Having been nominated at the Regular Meeting of December 20, 1962, Councilman Nielsen addressed the Council and moved that Mrs. Henry Wittpen and Mrs. Rosemary Bradley be reappointed as members of the Ann Land and Bertha Henschel Memorial Fund Commissions for terms expiring January 4, 1968. Seconded by Councilman Mering and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

Mr. Albert E. Bacon of 7577 Alma Vista Way, addressed the Council complaining of a police officer's investigation of a vehicular accident and suggested that a class of instructions be established for officers working in traffic investigations.

No action was taken by the Council, on the suggestion.

Having been continued from the Regular Meeting of December 20, 1962, and in accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 373

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO:

That the Mayor and City Clerk are hereby authorized to execute, for and on behalf of the City of Sacramento, that certain freeway agreement between the STATE OF CALIFORNIA and the CITY OF SACRAMENTO covering a freeway project on Route 242 between Rio Linda Blvd and Pinell Street.

Seconded by Councilman Domich and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

In accordance with bids received on date of December 20, 1962 and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Talkin moved that the bid of DeSoto Chemical Coatings, Inc., for furnishing the City's requirements of Traffic Line Paint for use by the Traffic Engineering Division, for the period ending December 31, 1963 and that the Mayor and City Clerk be authorized to execute Contract No. 510 when same has been approved and prepared by the City Attorney. Seconded by Councilman Marriott and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

With letter of transmittal, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Marriott moved that specifications for furnishing hydraulic aerial boom equipment for the Tree Division at an estimated cost of \$10,750.00, be adopted and the City Clerk instructed to advertise for bids thereon to be received up to the hour of 5:00 o'clock P.M. on date of January 17, 1963. Seconded by Councilman Talkin and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

With letter of transmittal, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Talkin moved that specifications for furnishing the City of Sacramento's gasoline requirements for a period of one year from February 1, 1963, to January 31, 1964, inclusive, be adopted and the City Clerk instructed to advertise for bids thereon to be received up to the hour of 5:00 o'clock P.M. on date of January 10, 1963. Seconded by Councilman Marriott and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

2432

2433

2434

2435

2436

2437 In accordance with report of the Superintendent of the Division of Water and Sewers and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Talkin moved that the work of the Baldwin Contracting Company, for the installation of water mains on 14th and 17th Streets, Q to N Street, be accepted as of date of December 21, 1962 and final payment therefor, authorized. Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

2438 In accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Rouse moved that the work of A. Teichert & Son, Inc., for the work of Sealing Various State Highways, be accepted as of December 19, 1962 and final payment therefor, authorized. Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

2439 In accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Nielsen moved that the work of Brighton Sand and Gravel Company, for the Resurfacing of Two City Streets, be accepted as of December 19, 1962 and final payment therefor, authorized. Seconded by Councilman Marriott and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

2440 In accordance with report from the City Planning Commission, President Pro-Tem Christensen announced that the date of January 10, 1963 at the hour of 7:45 o'clock P.M. would be the date and time for hearing on the appeal of Charles E. Brown, from decision of the City Planning Commission in denying his petition to rezone property located and described as Lot "B" of Meadowview Village #1, (SW corner of 24th Street and Meadowview Road) from the R - 3 Light Density Multiple-Family Zone to the C - 2 Community Commercial Zone in order to erect a service station on same.

2441 In accordance with report of the City Planning Commission, President Pro-Tem Christensen announced that the date of January 10, 1963 at the hour of 7:45 o'clock P.M. would be the date and time for hearing on the Major Street Plan as approved by the City Planning Commission.

Upon question of Councilman Nielsen relative to the possibility of changing traffic controlled devices on Q Street due to the two accidents involving trucks in the past two weeks, Traffic Engineer Stevens advised that a full traffic study of P and Q, 9th and 10th Streets, is being made and that if changes in traffic control devices are then indicated, they will be made.

2442 Communication from the Atomic Biological and Chemical Warfare Class of the Naval Reserve Officers School, extending thanks for lecture and presentation given by Mr. Peter T. Hanretty, was read and ordered placed on file.

2443 Letter from Mr. Sherman P. Sharp, expressing his opinion concerning the proposed jet airport in the vicinity of Natomas, was read and ordered filed.

2444 Communication from Mr. W. T. Shannon, Director of the State Department of Fish and Game, relative to waterfowl habitation in the vicinity of the proposed County Metropolitan Airport in the Natomas Airport was received, read and ordered filed.

2445 Communication from Philip E. Wagner relative to enforcement of parking regulations was received, read and ordered filed.

2446 Communication from Mrs. Any M. Rhein, suggesting a shuttle bus service on K and L, 5th - 16th Streets, was received and ordered filed.

2447 Oath of Office of Alvin Landis, as a member of the Transit Authority of the City of Sacramento, was ordered placed on file.

2448 Oath of Office of Frank B. Durkee, as a member of the Redevelopment Agency of the City of Sacramento, was received and ordered filed.

December 27, 1962

Annual Report 1961-1962 of the Civil Service Board and Personnel Department, was received and ordered placed on file.

2449

The City Manager presented an ordinance amending Section 25.88 of Chapter 25 of the Sacramento City Code relating to the removal of vehicles from streets together with a report on the subject.

2450

Following a brief discussion, the proposed ordinance was continued to the Regular Meeting of January 10, 1963.

In accordance with report of the Superintendent of the Division of Water and Sewers and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Domich moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 374

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO:

That the City Controller is authorized to transfer from 302 SURPLUS to 301-31 ADMINISTRATION AND GENERAL EXPENSE, the sum of \$9,000.00, for purchase of AMERICAN RIVER WATER under Contract No. 14-06-200-6497, with the U. S. Bureau of Reclamation for operation of the American River Filtration Plant in the calendar year 1963.

2451

Seconded by Councilman Mering and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

In accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Nielsen moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 3637
RESOLUTION OF INTENTION

Resolution of intention, which sets a hearing for date of January 17, 1963, in the matter of the proposed abandonment and vacating of the following described street:

All that portion of Belleau Wood Land as is shown on the official plat of Victory Acres, as filed in the office of the County Recorder of Sacramento County, lying between two lines described as follows:

(a) The westerly line of the portion of Belleau Wood Lane being abandoned is described as beginning at the southwest corner of Lot 10 of said Victory Acres; thence from said point of beginning, South 02° 43' 38" East 100.25 feet; thence South 02° 16' 14" West 332.52 feet.

2452

(b) The easterly line of the portion of Belleau Wood Lane being abandoned is the westerly right of wayline of Freeport Boulevard as widened by the State of California, Division of Highways.

(Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1962 on file in office of the City Clerk).

Seconded by Councilman Domich and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

In accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Nielsen moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION OF AWARD NO. 3626

Resolution of award to C.C. Young Co., in amount of \$2,750.00, for the construction of a Sewer Main, together with all necessary appurtenances, in Rights of Way described as the North 5.00 feet of the South 10.00 feet of Lot 2, and the South 5.00 feet of the West 64.00 feet of Lot 2, and the South 5.00 feet of the East 76.00 feet of the West 485.50 feet of Lot 2, as said Lot is shown on the Plat of Youngs Addition to Lake House Acres (as the same is recorded in the office of the Sacramento County Recorder). (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1962 on file in office of the City Clerk).

2453

Seconded by Councilman Domich and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

In accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Nielsen moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION EXTENDING TIME NO. 3546

2454 Resolution extending time to Lentz Construction Co., or its assigns, sixty (60) days in the matter of the construction of a Sanitary Sewer System, complete with all necessary appurtenances, in Wm. Dreher Tract Sanitary Sewer District. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1962 on file in office of the City Clerk).

Seconded by Councilman Domich and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

2455 Petition from householders and residents situated on the South side of I Street between 26th and 27th Streets, opposing the installation of parking meters in abovescribed block, was received and referred to the City Manager for a report.

2456 Petition opposing the proposal of the City of Sacramento to use McClellan Field for airport facilities, was received and filed with other petitions and communications concerning the proposed Metropolitan Airport, for consideration at a future public hearing on the matter.

2457 Communication from the California Labor Federation, AFL-CIO, forwarding a copy of their resolution adopted by their Fourth Convention in Long Beach, relative to "De Facto" school segregation, was received and ordered filed.

2458 Request from the State Division of Highways, for the cancellation of taxes on Lot 18, Plat of Howell Clark Tract, was received and referred to the City Manager for a report.

2459 Notice from the Public Utilities Commission relative to the application of American Buslines, Inc. for authority to abandon passenger stage service between Pittsburg and Sacramento, and for an in lieu certificate of public convenience and necessity authorizing all other passenger stage service, was received and referred to the City Manager.

2460 Copies of briefs before the Civil Aeronautics Board in the matter of West Coast Airlines, Inc. "Use It Or Lose It" Investigation and Route Realignment Case and in the matter of same, submitted by West Coast Airlines, Inc. to Examiner Walter W. Bryan and that of United Air Lines, Inc. submitted to Examiner Walter W. Bryan, was received and ordered filed.

2461 Communication from the California Almond Growers Exchange dated December 20, 1962, petitioning for the abandonment of A Street between 17th and 18th Streets was received, discussed and referred to the City Manager for a report.

2462 Request of Parker Engineering & Construction Co., on behalf of the Union Oil Company of California, for permission to install asphalt with an 8' right-of-way strip on Capitol Avenue was received and referred to the City Manager for a report.

2463 Request from the General Manager of the Capitol Towers Garden Apartments, for the appointment of N. B. Sinclair as a Special Police Officer for the premises bounded by 5th and N Streets, 7th and P Streets, (Capitol Towers Garden Apartments), was received and referred to the City Manager for a report.

2464 Request from the Christ Methodist Church, for permission to temporarily use a large house trailer on the site of their first permanent building for approximately one year at premises located at 7480-24th Street, was received and referred to the City Manager for a report.

2465 Attorney Edward P. Freidberg presented a claim on behalf of Christine H. Anderson, in amount of \$20,500.00, for injuries alleged to have been sustained due to a fall on premises located at 2424 Castro Way, and same was considered at this time.

Councilman Nielsen moved that foregoing claim be rejected and referred to the City's Insurance Carrier for disposition. Seconded by Councilman Talkin and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

December 27, 1962

ABSENT: Councilman McKinney.

Council adjourned at the hour of 10:10 o'clock P.M.

APPROVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL ON DATE
OF JANUARY 3, 1963

James B. McKinney
MAYOR

ATTEST:

Reginald S. Boyce
CITY CLERK