

REGULAR MEETING
SACRAMENTO CITY COUNCIL
January 9, 1964

The Honorable City Council met in Regular Session on this date at hour of 7:50 o'clock P. M., Mayor McKinney presiding and roll call was answered as follows:

PRESENT: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Rouse.

The City Clerk reported having furnished each member with a copy of proceedings of previous meeting. The minutes of the Regular Meeting of January 2, 1964, were ordered approved.

- - - - -

The following bids were received and referred to the City Manager for a report:

ONE (1) LOW BED, TANDEM AXLE, GOOSE NECK, SEMI-TRAILER

	FONTAINE TRUCK EQUIPMENT CO. 165 W. Juana Avenue San Leandro, California	FRUEHAUF CORPORATION 3600 West Capitol Avenue West Sacramento, California
MANUFACTURER:	Fontaine Truck Equipment Co.	Fruehauf Corporation
TOTAL PRICE	\$4,885.00	\$5,950.00
DISCOUNT FOR CASH	None	None
DELIVERY	60 days	75 days
B.F.S.S. ID. NO.	63-0251636	38-0561190
BID DEPOSIT	5% Bid Bond	\$297.50 Certified Check

4748

	TENCO TRACTOR 8780 Fruitridge Road Sacramento, California	HEIL EQUIPMENT COMPANY 999 Sixteenth Street San Francisco, California
MANUFACTURER	Hyster	Wisconsin
TOTAL PRICE	\$6,130.00	\$6,527.50
DISCOUNT FOR CASH	2%	2%
DELIVERY	45 days	45 days
B.F.S.S. ID. NO.	94-1237471	94-1111058
BID DEPOSIT	\$307.00 Certified Check	\$325.00 Certified Check.

GASOLINE REQUIREMENTS FOR A PERIOD OF ONE YEAR, (from February 1, 1964 to January 31, 1965).

Item 1: 400,000 gallons, more or less, "Regular" type gasoline
Item 2: 400,000 gallons, more or less, "Regular" type gasoline
Item 3: 25,000 gallons, more or less, "Premium" type gasoline
Item 4: 10,000 gallons, more or less, "Regular" type gasoline

(PRICE PER GALLON)	UNION OIL CO. OF CALIF. P. O. Box 1948 Sacramento, California	STANDARD OIL CO. OF CALIF. 909 - 12th Street Sacramento, California
ITEM 1		
PRICE	.1785	.1805
ITEM 2		
PRICE	.191	.1875
ITEM 3		
PRICE	*	*
ITEM 4		
PRICE	*	*
B.F.S.S. ID. NO.	95-1315-450	94-0890210
BID DEPOSIT	\$8,100.00 Cashier's Check	\$7,500.00 Certified Check

4749

	TIDEWATER OIL COMPANY 324 West Broadway Sacramento, California	RICHFIELD OIL CORPORATION 555 South Flower Street Los Angeles, California 90054
ITEM 1		
PRICE	.1828	.1841*
ITEM 2		
PRICE	.1878	.1891*
ITEM 3		
PRICE	*	*
ITEM 4		
PRICE	*	*
B.F.S.S. ID. NO.	95-2005886	95-1149340
BID DEPOSIT	5% Bid Bond	\$9,000.00 Certified Check

	TEXACO, INC. 1601 Fulton Avenue Sacramento, California	WESTERN HYWAY OIL CO. P. O. Box 655 West Sacramento, California
ITEM 1		
PRICE	\$.1869	\$.1925
ITEM 2		
PRICE	.1969	No Bid
ITEM 3		
PRICE	No Bid	No Bid
ITEM 4		
PRICE	No Bid	No Bid
B.F.S.S. ID. NO.	74-138-3447	95-1-222-940
BID DEPOSIT	5% Bid Bond	\$3,850.00 Certified Check

* See Original Bid

- - - - -

Donald I Rivett, newly appointed member of the Historic Landmarks Commission, appeared and Oath of Office was administered by the City Clerk and said oath of office filed

4750

Linda Renfree, Chairman, City Employees March of Dimes Campaign addressed the Council announcing that a cake sale would be held in the Council Chamber, January 29, 1964, at 2:00 o'clock p. m.

This having been the date set for hearing and no protests having been received, the City Manager presented and Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION ORDERING WORK NO. 3700

Resolution ordering work, which calls to be received up to the hour of 5:00 o'clock p. m., on date of January 30, 1964, in the matter of the improvement of South Land Park Hills Unit No. 40 Assessment District. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk). Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

4751

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen and Talkin.
ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Rouse.

This having been the date set for hearing and no protests having been received, the City Manager presented and Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION APPROVING ASSESSMENT NO. 3658

Resolution approving assessment in the matter of improving the Easterly one-half of Redding Avenue lying between the center line of San Joaquin Street and a point located 678.40 feet Northerly. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4752

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Rouse.

This having been the date set for hearing and no protests having been received, the City Manager presented and Councilman Marriott moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION APPROVING ASSESSMENT NO. 3664

Resolution approving assessment in the matter of constructing a water distribution system, complete with all necessary appurtenances, in Elder Creek Road lying between a point located 150 feet West of the Westerly line of Ring Drive and the center line of Elder Creek Road to the Center line of Lemon Hill Avenue. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4753

Seconded by Councilman Christensen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Rouse.

NOT VOTING: Councilman Nielsen.

Hearing on the assessment in the matter of improving Hughes Avenue, Freeport Boulevard, Freeport Manor No. 2, (3656) having been held on January 2, 1964, was again considered, no further protestants appearing, Councilman Christensen moved that hearing be closed and the following resolution adopted:

RESOLUTION APPROVING ASSESSMENT NO. 3656

Resolution approving assessment in the matter of improving Hughes Avenue from the Center line of Freeport Boulevard to the Easterly Boundary of Freeport Manor Unit No. 2. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4754

Seconded by Councilman Talkin and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Rouse.

Oliver B. Cook, 937 - 38th Street addressed Council requesting that a separate pedestrian light be installed at the intersection of 39th and J Streets.

The City Traffic Engineer announced that he had initiated a study of this intersection and would present a report in about thirty days.

With letter of transmittal, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Marriott moved that specifications for street improvement 5th and N Streets Redevelopment Area No. 2A, be adopted and the City Clerk instructed to advertise for bids thereon to be received up to the hour of 5:00 o'clock p. m. on date of January 23, 1964.

4755

Seconded by Councilman Christensen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Rouse.

The City Clerk having reported that terms of office of Walter Buehler, Earl Warren Jr. and George W. Reed, would expire February 2, 1964 as members of the City Planning Commission, the Mayor announced that nominations for said positions would be considered at regular meeting of January 16, 1964.

Councilman Rouse arrived at this time.

In accordance with request of Councilman Christensen, Councilman Nielsen moved that Councilman Christensen and the Chairman of the Sacramento Transit Authority be authorized to represent the City of Sacramento at the National Conference of Urban Transportation Institute of the United States Chamber of Commerce.

4756

Seconded by Councilman Mering and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Councilman Marriott addressed Council concerning the safety problem of school crossing guards at the Collis P. Huntington School and was advised by the City Traffic Engineer that red jackets would be provided the school crossing guards.

Mayor McKinney announced that invitations would be extended to members of the Council to attend a luncheon meeting at the Crocker Art Gallery, Tuesday, February 4, 1964, to view recent improvements at the gallery.

Copy of letter of thanks addressed to Donald Smith, Manager of the Airport from Senator Randolph Collier, for presentation made by Mr. Smith before the Senate and Assembly Transportation Committees, was read and ordered filed.

4757

Card of thanks for sympathy extended from the Roy C. Hicks family, was ordered filed.

4758

Card of thanks for sympathy extended from the Maleville family, was ordered filed.

4759

In accordance with request, report of the manager of the Sacramento Memorial Auditorium and verbal recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Murphy moved that request of the Magellan Post No. 604, American Legion for free use of the Sacramento Memorial Auditorium on Wednesday, June 24, 1964 be denied.

4760

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Petition from the Southern Pacific Company requesting annexation of 123 acres of Southern Pacific Co. Railroad owned property at Perkins lying southerly of Jackson Highway and Westerly of Florin-Perkins Road, was considered and Councilman Murphy moved that petition be referred to the Local Agency Formation Commission with a request for the earliest possible action.

4761

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 8

4762

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO:

That the City Controller is hereby authorized to pay to the League of California Cities, Hotel Claremont Berkeley 5, California, the amount of \$3,454.00 from City Council Budget No. 1, for Annual Service Charge for the calendar year 1964.

4762

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Rouse moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 9

Resolution granting a revocable permit to the State of California in connection with construction of several parking lots in the vicinity of the new Motor Vehicle Building south of Broadway. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4763

Seconded by Councilman Murphy and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Talkin moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 10

Resolution approving grant deed to Mac-Cor, Inc., for sale of abandoned well site and easement, adjacent to Lot 81, Golf Course Village Unit No. 2, et al. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4764

Seconded by Councilman Murphy and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Nielsen moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 11

Resolution cancelling taxes on various parcels of property acquired by the State of California. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4765

Seconded by Councilman Mering and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 12

Resolution cancelling the remainder of the 1963-64 City taxes on various parcels of land purchased by the City of Sacramento. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4766

Seconded by Councilman Talkin and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Nielsen moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 13

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO:

That the Mayor and City Clerk are hereby authorized and directed to sign and execute on behalf of the

4767

City of Sacramento that certain lease agreement dated December 1, 1963, by and between the City of Sacramento Lessee, and Gustaf C. and Alice C. Blomberg, Lessors, whereby the City leases from lessors a portion of the building at 5681 Freeport Boulevard, Sacramento, for use as a public library, for a term of one year commencing December 1, 1963, to and including November 30, 1964.

4767

Seconded by Councilman Christensen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.
ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 14

Resolution transferring funds to various budgets in accordance with Ordinance No. 2526, Fourth Series, approved December 19, 1963, to become effective January 1, 1964, whereby the salaries of City employees were increased. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4768

Seconded by Councilman Rouse and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.
ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Murphy moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 15

Resolution authorizing the City Treasurer purchase \$650,000.00 U. S. Treasury Bills, (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4769

Seconded by Councilman Talkin and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.
ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Hearing on the assessment in the matter of the construction of sanitary sewers and pumping station in the North Pocket Area Sewer Assessment District No. 3428, having been held and closed on date of January 2, 1964, and protests referred to the City Manager for a report, the City Manager presented and Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION APPROVING ASSESSMENT NO. 3428

Resolution approving assessment 3428 for the installations of sewers in the North Pocket Area Sewer Assessment District No. 3428. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4770

Seconded by Councilman Talkin and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.
ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

In accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION EXTENDING TIME NO. 3649

Resolution extending time to Cotter Electrical Company for an additional thirty (30) days in the matter of Construction of a street lighting system, complete with all necessary appurtenances, in Irvin Way from the Easterly Boundary of Hollywood Park Unit No. 3 to the center line of 24th Street, et al. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4771

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.
ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

In accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION OF EXTENDING TIME NO. 3669

Resolution extending time to C. P. McAuley for an additional sixty (60) days in the matter of constructing a water distribution system, complete with all necessary appurtenances in the Alley between 47th and 48th Avenues from the center line of 25th Street to the Easterly line of Woodbine Avenue, and 25th Street from the center line of 47th Avenue to the center line of the alley first Southerly of 47th Avenue. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

1772

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

- AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.
- ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

In accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION OF AWARD NO. 3690

Resolution of awards to Lentz Construction Company in amount of \$7,357.00, in the matter of construction of a Water Distribution System, complete with all necessary appurtenances, in Elder Creek Road from the center line of 63rd Street, North, to the center line of Stockton Boulevard. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

1773

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

- AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.
- ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

In accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 3703

Resolution approving petition and waiver No. 3703, in the matter of the improvement of Rose Mead Circle, Farm Dale Way, Silver Ridge Way, Stanwood Way and Sunland Vista Avenue, as shown on the plat of South Land Park Hills Unit No. 28. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

1774

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

- AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.
- ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

In accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 3704

Resolution approving petition and waiver No. 3704, in the matter of the improvement of Benhan Way, Arabella Way, Trudy Way and Harmon Drive, as shown on the Plat of South Land Park Village Unit No. 1, (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

1775

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

- AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.
- ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

In accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Nielsen moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 3705

Resolution approving petition and waiver No. 3705, in the matter of the improvement of 65th Avenue, Swift Way and 67th Avenue, as shown on the Plat of Mayfair Gardens Unit No. 9. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1964, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

1776

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

- AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.
- ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

4777 Report of Motor Vehicle License Fee Fund apportionments for the period of June 1, 1963 through November 30, 1963, was referred to the City Manager.

4778 Various requests from the State Division of Highways for cancellation of taxes, were referred to the City Manager for a report.

Claim submitted by Attorney Richard A. Case on behalf of Ted Sattler, in amount of \$15,000.00 for injuries alleged to have been sustained from a sidewalk fall at 26th Street and Capitol Avenue, consideration was had at this time.

4779 Councilman Mering moved that foregoing claim be rejected and referred to the City's Insurance Carrier for disposition.

Seconded by Councilman Rouse and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Claim submitted by Attorney William K. Morgan on behalf of Jessie Mae Villanueva, in amount of \$1,500.00 for injuries alleged to have been sustained from a sidewalk fall in front of 2500 - 21st Street, consideration was had at this time.

4780 Councilman Mering moved that foregoing claim be rejected and referred to the City's Insurance Carrier for disposition.

Seconded by Councilman Rouse and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Claim submitted by Alvin W. Beardsley on behalf of Mrs. Agnes May Wheeler, for injuries alleged to have been sustained from a fall in the Memorial Auditorium, consideration was had at this time.

Councilman Mering moved that foregoing claim be rejected and referred to the City's Insurance Carrier for disposition.

4781 Seconded by Councilman Rouse and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Claim submitted by Attorney William K. Morgan on behalf of Shawn Cobb, in amount of \$500.00 for injuries alleged to have been sustained from a sidewalk fall in front of 2500 - 21st Street, consideration was had at this time.

4782 Councilman Mering moved that foregoing claim be rejected and referred to the City's Insurance Carrier for disposition.

Seconded by Councilman Rouse and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Claim submitted by Attorney Floyd V. Gibbert on behalf of Eugene Foster, in amount of \$20,000.00, for injuries alleged to have been sustained from a sidewalk fall, in the vicinity of 1621 - 34th Street, consideration was had at this time.

4783 Councilman Mering moved that foregoing claim be rejected and referred to the City's Insurance Carrier for disposition.

Seconded by Councilman Rouse and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

4784 Claim submitted by Mrs. Lillian E. Lagomarsino, for injuries alleged to have been sustained from a sidewalk fall in front of 1209 - 38th Street, consideration was had at this time.

Councilman Mering moved that foregoing claim be rejected and referred to the City's Insurance Carrier for disposition.

Seconded by Councilman Rouse and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

-

Petition of the City of Oakland, California, acting by and through its Board of Port Commissioners for leave to intervene in the matter of the application of Frontier Airlines, Inc., for amendment of its Certificate of Public Convenience and Necessity in regard to route 73 (Docket No. 14136), was ordered filed.

4785

Councilman Nielsen moved that Mayor McKinney and Vice Mayor Christensen be authorized to leave the State in order to attend meetings of the U. S. Conference of Mayors and the National Conference of Urban Transportation respectively.

4786

Seconded by Councilman Murphy and carried by the following vote:

Councilmen

AYES:/ Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Council adjourned at the hour of 9:05 o'clock p. m.

APPROVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL ON DATE OF
JANUARY 16, 1964

James B. McKinney
MAYOR

ATTEST:

Reginald H. Eggs
CITY CLERK