

SPECIAL MEETING
SACRAMENTO CITY COUNCIL
December 26, 1963

The Honorable City Council met in Special Session on this date at the hour of 4:10 o'clock p. m., Mayor McKinney presiding and roll call was answered as follows:

PRESENT: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Executed copies of the call of the meeting issued by the Mayor and presented by the Chief Deputy City Clerk, were ordered filed.

The call stated the purpose of the meeting to be that of considering rate structure or self-supporting departments and to present such other matters as may regularly come before said body or be presented by the City Manager. 4674

City Manager Cavanaugh addressed Council explaining proposal in detail to increase City charges for storm water drainage, commercial sewage disposal, and parking on down-town municipal lots.

Councilman Domich arrived at this time.

In accordance with recommendation of the City Manager, to increase commercial accounts only, sewer service rates, from one-third to one-half of water service charge, discussion of the proposed ordinance was continued to Regular Meeting of January 16, 1964.

After hearing a verbal report from Ray Jones, Superintendent of the Division of Water and Sewers that the Division would incur a loss of \$164,000.00 approximately in the 1964 fiscal year ending June 30, 1964, Councilman Mering moved that \$164,000.00 be transferred from the unappropriated reserve to the sewer fund. 4675

Seconded by Councilman Murphy and carried by the following vote:

Councilmen
AYES:/ Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse, and Talkin.

Recommendation by the City Manager for a \$.05 increase in the hourly rate for the first two hours on the down-town parking lots was discussed and referred to the Off-Street Parking Committee for a report.

Council adjourned at the hour of 5:50 o'clock p. m.

APPROVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL ON DATE OF
DECEMBER 26, 1963

James B. McKinney
MAYOR

ATTEST:

JW Oldham
CHIEF DEPUTY CITY CLERK

REGULAR MEETING
SACRAMENTO CITY COUNCIL
December 26, 1963

The Honorable City Council met in Regular Session on this date at the hour of 7:48 o'clock p. m., Mayor McKinney presiding and roll call was answered as follows:

PRESENT: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

The Chief Deputy City Clerk reported having furnished each member with a copy of proceedings of previous meeting. The minutes of the Regular Meeting of December 19, 1963 and Special Meeting of December 26, 1963, were ordered approved.

The following bids were received and referred to the City Manager for a report:

3682 CONSTRUCTION OF A WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM COMPLETE, IN ALPINE WATER ASSESSMENT DISTRICT.

| | <u>TOTAL PRICE</u> | <u>BID DEPOSIT</u> |
|--|--------------------|--------------------|
| LENTZ CONSTRUCTION COMPANY P. O. Box 7538 Sacramento, California 95828 | \$36,408.00 | 10% Bid Bond |
| C. P. McAULEY 6421 Hogan Drive Sacramento, California 95822 | \$36,490.00 | 10% Bid Bond |
| LUPPEN AND HAWLEY, INC. 3126 J Street Sacramento, California 95816 | \$36,841.00 | 10% Bid Bond |
| 4676 LOUIS F. WUNSCHEL 1221 Stewart Road Sacramento, California 95825 | \$36,894.00 | 10% Bid Bond |
| HARMS BROS 5261 Stockton Boulevard Sacramento, California | \$37,184.00 | 10% Bid Bond |
| DELZER PIPELINE CONSTRUCTION, INC. 8148 Fair Oaks Boulevard Carmichael, California | \$37,606.00 | 10% Bid Bond |
| CORDOVA PUMP & MFG. COMPANY 2751 Kilgore Road Rancho Cordova, California | \$38,930.00 | 10% Bid Bond |
| W. O. G. PIPE LINES 3019 - 65th Street Sacramento, California | \$38,994.00 | 10% Bid Bond |
| A & E PIPELINES, INC. P. O. BOX 7186 Sacramento, California | \$39,000.00 | 10% Bid Bond |
| GEORGE F. McFARLAND COMPANY 5212 Argo Way Sacramento, California | \$40,969.00 | 10% Bid Bond |

VARIOUS TYPES OF FILTER SAND (SACRAMENTO RIVER FILTRATION PLANT)

| | | |
|--|--|---|
| MONTEREY SAND CO., INC. P. O. Box 928 Monterey, California | PACIFIC CEMENT & AGGREGATES, INC. 400 Alabama Street San Francisco, Calif. | CRYSTAL SILICA CO. Box 1280 Oceanside, California |
|--|--|---|

| | | | |
|--|--------------------------|------------------------|----------------|
| FOUR HUNDRED TWENTY (420 TONS MEDIUM FILTER SAND) | | | |
| PRICE PER TON | \$13.10 | \$14.31 | \$21.50 |
| TOTAL PRICE | \$5,502.00 | \$6,010.20 | \$9,030.00 |
| 4677 THIRTY-FIVE (35) TONS "TORPEDO" FILTER SAND | | | |
| PRICE PER TON | \$13.10 | \$14.31 | \$21.50 |
| TOTAL PRICE | \$458.50 | \$500.85 | \$9,030.00 |
| TOTAL | \$5,960.50 | \$6,511.05 | \$18,060.00 |
| DISCOUNT FOR CASH | None | Net cash | None |
| B. F. S. S. ID. NO. | 94-153-6952 | 94-0740439 | 95-066-2150 |
| BID DEPOSIT | \$298.03 Certified Check | \$325.55 Certified Ck. | No bid deposit |

STREET PAVING MATERIALS:

A. TEICHERT & SON, INC. ARDEN SAND & GRAVEL
 1931 Stockton Boulevard INC.
 Sacramento, California 5700 Arden Way
 Carmichael, Calif.

| | <u>PRICE PER TON</u> | <u>PRICE PER TON</u> |
|---|----------------------|--------------------------|
| ITEM I: | | |
| 1/4" x No. 10 Crushed Gravel Screenings | \$1.80 | \$1.90 |
| 3/8" x No. 6 Crushed Gravel Screenings | \$1.83 | \$1.90 |
| 3/4" x 1/2" Crushed Gravel Screenings | \$1.65 | \$1.60 |
| ITEM II: | | |
| 1 1/2" Aggregate Base Class 2 | \$1.25 | \$1.15 |
| ITEM III: | | |
| 1/2" Maximum Asphaltic Concrete | \$3.78 | \$3.80 |
| 3/4" Maximum Asphaltic Concrete | \$3.72 | \$3.80 |
| ITEM IV: | | |
| 1/2 " Maximum Cutback Mixture | \$4.15 | \$4.25 |
| DISCOUNT FOR CASH | None | \$.10 per ton-15th Prox. |
| BIDDER'S F..S.S. ID. NO. | 94-0919260 | 94-0798340 |
| BID DEPOSIT | 10% Bid Bond | 10% Bid Bond |

GRANITE CONSTN. CO. WALDON AGGREGATES
 P. O. BOX 900 7601 - 14th Avenue
 Watsonville, California Sacramento, California

| | <u>PRICE PER TON</u> | <u>PRICE PER TON</u> |
|--|----------------------|----------------------|
| ITEM I: 10 | | |
| 1/4" x No./Crushed Gravel Screenings | \$2.10 | \$2.25 |
| 3/8" X No. 6 Crushed Gravel Screenings | \$2.10 | \$2.15 |
| 3/4" x 1/2" Crushed Gravel Screenings | \$1.70 | \$2.00 |
| ITEM II: | | |
| 1 1/2" Aggregate Base Class 2 | \$1.15 | \$1.00 |
| ITEM III: | | |
| 1/2" Maximum Asphaltic Concrete | \$3.75 | \$4.20 |
| 3/4" Maximum Asphaltic Concrete | \$3.75 | \$4.10 |
| ITEM IV: | | |
| 1/2" Maximum Cutback Mixture | \$4.50 | \$4.20 |
| DISCOUNT FOR CASH | Net | Net |
| B. F. S. S. ID. NO. | 94-0519552 | 94-1210149 |
| BID DEPOSIT | 5% Bid Bond | 5% Bid Bond |

4678

BRIGHTON SAND & GRAVEL CO.
 Jackson Road
 Sacramento, California

| | <u>PRICE PER TON</u> |
|---|----------------------|
| ITEM I: | |
| 1/4" x No. 10 Crushed Gravel Screenings | \$ No Bid |
| 3/8X x No. 6 Crushed Gravel Screenings | |
| 3/4" x 1/2" Crushed Gravel Screenings | |
| ITEM II: | |
| 1 1/2" Aggregate Base Class 2 | \$1.05 |
| ITEM III: | |
| 1/2" Maximum Asphaltic Concrete | \$3.75 |
| 3/4" Maximum Asphaltic Concrete | \$3.75 |
| ITEM IV: | |
| 1/2" Maximum Cutback Mixture | \$4.10 |
| DISCOUNT FOR CASH | \$.10/ton |
| B.F.S.S. ID. NO. | 94-1104018 |
| BID DEPOSIT | 5% Bid Bond |

VARIOUS TYPES OF ASPHALT

- 1: Emulsified Asphalt (Cationic, Rapid Setting Type)
- 2: Penetration Type Emulsified Asphalt

AMERICAN BITUMULS & DOUGLAS OIL CO. OF
 ASPHALT COMPANY CALIFORNIA
 4525 San Leandro Street 1515 - 65th Street
 Oakland, California Sacramento, California

| | | |
|--|-----------------|-----------------|
| ITEM NO. I: | | |
| PRICE PER TON | \$28.40 | \$28.40 |
| For Delivery Only; free time: | 1 1/2 hours | 1 1/2 hours |
| Rate per hour (prorated) for demurrage | \$7.75 | \$7.75 |
| For Delivery & Spreading; free time: | 2 hours | 2 hours |
| Rate per hour (prorated) for demurrage | \$9.25 per hour | \$9.25 per hour |
| Spreading, price per ton | \$1.30 | \$1.30 |

4679

ITEM NO. II:

| | | |
|---------------------|---------------------------|-------------------------|
| PRICE PER GALLON | NO BID | \$0.13 |
| B. F. S. S. ID. NO. | 94-0279270 | 95-2124734 |
| BID DEPOSIT | \$115000 Certified Check | 5% Bid Bond |
| | SHELL OIL COMPANY | A. TEICHERT & SON, INC. |
| | 100 Bush Street | 1931 Stockton Boulevard |
| | San Francisco, California | Sacramento, California |

4679 ITEM NO. I:

| | | |
|--|-------------|--------|
| PRICE PER TON | \$28.40 | No Bid |
| For Delivery Only: free time: | 1-1/2 hours | |
| Rate per hour (prorated) for demurrage | \$7.75 | |
| For Delivery & Spreading: free time | 2 hours | |
| Rate per hour (prorated) for demurrage | \$9.25 | |
| Spreading, price per ton: | \$1.30 | |

ITEM NO. II:

| | | |
|------------------|--------------|--------------|
| PRICE PER GALLON | \$0.0979 | \$0.136 |
| B.F.S.S. ID NO. | 13-1299890 | 94-0919260 |
| BID DEPOSIT | 5 % Bid Bond | 10% Bid Bond |

This having been the date set for hearing and no protests having been received, Councilman Rouse presented the following ordinance moving that it be brought to immediate vote:

ORDINANCE NO. 2527, FOURTH SERIES

AN ORDINANCE NAMING AND DESIGNATING THE STREET FROM THE 5700 BLOCK ELVAS AVENUE SOUTH TO H STREET AS 56TH STREET. (Reference is hereby made to original ordinance adopted on this date and set out in full in Ordinance Book 1963, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse, and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

4680

Councilman Rouse thereupon moved that foregoing Ordinance be adopted.

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Domich.

Councilman Domich arrived at this time.

This having been the date set for nominations to the Historic Landmarks Commission for a term expiring June 30, 1965 (vice William Mahan, resigned), Councilman Nielsen placed the name of Donald I Rivett in nomination.

4681

Councilman Rouse moved that nominations be closed.

Seconded by Councilman Mering and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

This having been the date set for appointment of Archie Crossland to the Transit Authority for term expiring December 31, 1968, Councilman Mering Moved that Mr. Crossland be so appointed.

4682

Seconded by Councilman Rouse and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

This having been the date set for appointment of James F. Alexander to the Civil Service Board for a term expiring December 31, 1968, Councilman Marriott moved that Mr. Alexander be so appointed.

4683

Seconded by Councilman Domich and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

This having been the date set for the appointment of Mary E. Johnson and Mrs. Howard Odbert to the Ann Land and Bertha Henschel Memorial Fund Commission, for terms expiring January 4, 1969, Councilman Nielsen moved that Mrs. Johnson and Mrs. Odbert be so appointed.

4684

Seconded by Councilman Mering and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

In accordance with bids received on date of December 12, 1963, and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Domich moved that the bid of Capital Wholesale Electric Company, in the amount of \$7,500.00 (approximately), for furnishing the City's requirements of incandescent and fluorescent lamps for a period of one year, from January 1, 1964 to December 31, 1964, and the Mayor and City Clerk be authorized to execute Contract No. 601, when same has been prepared and approved by the City Attorney.

4685

Seconded by Councilman Talkin and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

In accordance with bids received on date of December 19, 1963, and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Christensen moved that the bid of F. B. Hart Company, 1445 Richards Boulevard, Sacramento, California, in the amount of \$8,054.05 for furnishing a truck chassis, service body and wrecker for use of the Corporation Yard garage, and the Mayor and City Clerk be authorized to execute Contract No. 602, when same has been prepared and approved by the City Attorney.

4686

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilman Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Domich moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 776

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO:

That Henry Moss, owner of the property at 711 J Street is hereby granted a revocable permit to construct a wall for architectural purposes over City sidewalk on the front of said property.

This permit is granted with the following conditions:

1. The dimensions and construction of the wall shall be as follows:
 - a. The bottom of the wall shall be a minimum of 10 feet above the sidewalk.
 - b. The top of the wall shall be a maximum of 30 feet above the sidewalk.
 - c. The front of the wall shall be a maximum of 5 feet south of the north property line of J Street.
 - d. At the east and west ends of the wall a return wall to the property line shall be built.
 - e. The length of the wall on J Street shall be 63 feet.
 - f. The wall shall be built of incombustible material.
 - g. The structural features of the wall shall meet the approval of the Building Inspector.
 - h. The owner may construct the building roof beyond his property line to meet and support the vertical wall on public property.
 - i. Between the bottom of the wall and the building an incombustible ceiling or filler shall be installed.
2. No use of the space between the architectural wall and the building wall on the property line will be permitted.
3. The only sign permitted on the front of the architectural wall shall be a single flat sign on the front of the central panels, said sign consisting of not more than two rows of 12 inch letters with a total sign length not to exceed 14 feet. A flat sign may be installed on each of the two return side panels consisting of a single row of numbers not to exceed 18 inches high and 4 feet long.
4. Permittee shall protect and save the City of Sacramento harmless from all damages, costs and causes of action in connection with the granting of this permit.

4687

Seconded by Councilman Rouse and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

Councilman Mering addressed Council suggesting that the Uniform Building Code should be scrutinized with a view to making change in the section regarding marquees,

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Talkin moved that the following resolution be adopted.

RESOLUTION NO. 777

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO:

That Edwin J. Bedell is hereby granted a revocable permit for the purpose of construction of a planter fronting the property at 3001 N Street.

4688

The property involved is the northerly two feet (2') of street right of way of "N" Street from a point ninety feet (90") east of the east property line of 30th Street to a point one hundred sixty-one feet (161') east of the east property line of 30th Street.

This permit is granted with the following conditions:

4688

1. That permittee shall protect and save the City of Sacramento harmless from all damages, costs and causes of action in connection with the granting of this permit.
2. That permittee shall determine the location of and protect and support all utilities in the public rights of way, and shall bear the entire cost of any necessary relocation or reconstruction made necessary by reason of settlement or other damage to utilities.

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

- - - - -

In accordance with request, recommendation of the Chief of Police and recommendation of the City Manager filed on this date, Councilman Talkin moved that Robert Uhls be appointed a special officer for premises of the Odd Fellows' Lawn Cemetery.

4689

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

- - - - -

4690

With letter of transmittal which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Murphy moved that specifications for furnishing one (1) low bed trailer for use of the Street Maintenance Division at an estimated cost of \$6,000.00 and the City Clerk instructed to advertise for bids thereon to be received up to the hour of 5:00 o'clock p. m. on date of January 9, 1964.

Seconded by Councilman Domich and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

- - - - -

4691

With letter of transmittal, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Murphy moved that specifications for furnishing the City's gasoline requirements for a period of one year, from date of February 1, 1964 to January 31, 1965, inclusive at an estimated cost of \$150,000.00, be adopted and the City Clerk instructed to advertise for bids thereon to be received up to the hour of 5:00 o'clock p. m. on date of January 9, 1964.

Seconded by Councilman Domich and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

- - - - -

4692

In accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager filed on this date, Councilman Domich moved that the recommendation of the Historical Area Consultants, concerning the retention of certain buildings along the east side of Second Street during freeway construction be approved.

Seconded by Councilman Murphy and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

- - - - -

4693

In accordance with request filed with the City Council December 19, 1963 and recommendation of the City Manager filed on this date, Councilman Talkin moved that the International Kart Federation be invited to hold their meet at the site of the Sacramento Kartway for 1964 Grand National Sprint and Enduro Championship races.

Seconded by Councilman Marriott and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

- - - - -

Councilman Domich announced that an arrangement had been worked out with the Redevelopment Agency to provide certain secretarial services to the Historic Landmarks Commission under the direction of a part time consultant, further stating that no funds were necessary at this time to provide for this service.

- - - - -

4694

In accordance with appeal, report of the City Planning Commission, Councilman Marriott moved that a hearing be set for January 16, 1964, appealing City Planning Commission's denial of the request of Salvin Swanson to waive the westerly 5' side yard requirement and the northerly 15' rear yard requirement in order to erect a pickup or agency building for a dry cleaning establishment at 2831 I Street.

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Planning Commission, Councilman Marriott moved that hearing on the request to rezone property described as Lot 35 of J Street Subdivision, Tract No. 5, from R-1 One Family Zone to R-3 Light Density Multiple Family Zone, be set for January 16, 1964.

4695

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Planning Commission, Councilman Marriott moved that hearing on the request to rezone property described as Parcels 1 and 2 page 5 and Parcel 3 page 3 Book 36 of County Assessor's Books, from R-1 One Family Zone to M1-IP and M2-IP Zones, be set for January 16, 1964.

4696

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Planning Commission, Councilman Marriott moved that hearing on the request to rezone property described as follows; be set for January 16, 1964:

WEST MENDOCINO BOULEVARD UNINHABITED ANNEXATION AREA:
A parcel consisting of Lots 10029-30-31 and 100932 of Fruitridge Park.

WEST FRANKLIN BOULEVARD UNINHABITED ANNEXATION AREA:
A parcel of land containing approximately 65.7 acres and lying south of Ehrhardt Avenue and west of Franklin Boulevard.

4697

SOUTH JACKSON ROAD UNINHABITED ANNEXATION AREA:
A parcel of land lying south of Florin-Perkins Road and between Fruitridge Road and Jackson Road.

NORTH FLORIN-FRANKLIN ANNEXATION AREA:
A parcel of land containing approximately 100 acres and lying north of Florin Road, south of 52nd Avenue east of Western Pacific Railroad tracks and west of Franklin Boulevard.

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

Various communications for and against changing the name of Capitol Mall to Kennedy Mall, were considered at this time and Councilman Nielsen moved that name be not changed.

4698

Seconded by Councilman Christensen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

Upon request of Councilman Nielsen the Public Information Officer was instructed to publicize restrictions concerning the burning of trash in the City of Sacramento.

4699

Communication from Alice and Mary-Jane Shelley expressing appreciation for courtesy of two officers relative to "bonb threat" telephone call, was received and ordered filed.

4700

A communication from Bradford M. Crittenden, Commissioner, California Highway Patrol, expressing appreciation to Captain A. L. White and Officers Loy, Messerer, Richer and Schiele for the outstanding example of police tactics which resulted in the apprehension of the two felons at the Sacramento Airport on date of November 16, 1963, was received and ordered filed.

4701

A card of thanks from the Walter Kitt family, was received and ordered filed.

4702

A card of thanks from the Selland family, was received and ordered filed.

4703

4704 Season's Greeting from Greenhaven 70, was received and ordered filed.

4705 A communication from Melvin Powers relative to proposed hypnosis ordinance, was received and referred to the Public Health, Safety and Morals Committee.

4706 Communication from Gaston D. Beach concerning hazardous traffic conditions in the Dos Rios Housing area, was discussed and referred to the City Manager for a report.

4707 Communication from M. Entwistle regarding Christmas decorations on City Streets, was ordered filed.

4708 Communications from John Fourt, President, Sacramento Council for Equal Education and the Human Relations Committee recommending adoption resolutions opposing Anti-Fair Housing Initiative, were ordered filed.

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Nielsen moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 778

Resolution approving agreement with the Southern Pacific Company for the installation of a 12" water line in Ahern Street between North B Street and North C Street. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1963, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4709 Seconded by Councilman Mering and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Murphy.

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented and Councilman Domich moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 779

Resolution cancelling taxes on various parcels of property acquired by the State of California. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1963, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4710 Seconded by Councilman Mering and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Murphy.

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager Presented and Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 780

Resolution instructing Treasurer purchase \$2,160,000.00 U. S. Treasury Bills. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1963, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

4711 Seconded by Councilman Domich and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Murphy.

In accordance with report of the City Engineer and recommendation of the City Manager, filed on this date, Councilman Nielsen moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 3702

4712 Resolution approving petition and waiver No. 3702, in the matter of the improvement of the alley between N and O Streets from the Easterly line of 20th Street to the Westerly line of 21st Street. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1963, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

Seconded by Councilman Talkin and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Nielsen, Rouse and Talkin.

ABSENT: Councilman Murphy.

Communication from Magellan Post No. 604, requesting free use of the Memorial Auditorium for their Coronation and Ball on date of June 24, 1964, was received and referred to the City Manager.

4713

Report of the Civil Aeronautics Board showing the passenger traffic originating at all cities on the air-lines routes (Local Service Airlines) including the City of Sacramento, was ordered filed.

4714

Various requests of the State of California to cancel taxes on various parcels of property, were referred to the City Manager for a report.

4715

Notice from the Federal Aviation Agency Western Region of a proposal of the Pacific Gas and Electric Company to install a transmission line on steel pole and towers in the vicinity of the Natomas Airport, was ordered filed.

4716

A decision of the Public Utilities Commission establishing a list of Grade Separation Projects was referred to the City Manager.

4717

Council adjourned at the hour of 9:10 o'clock p. m.

APPROVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL ON DATE OF
JANUARY 2, 1964

James B. McKinney
MAYOR

ATTEST:

Ronald J. Briggs
CITY CLERK