

REGULAR MEETING
SACRAMENTO CITY COUNCIL
January 28, 1965

The Honorable City Council met in regular session on this date at the hour of 7:55 o'clock p. m., Mayor McKinney presiding and roll call was answered as follows:

Councilmen Christensen, Domich, McKinney, Mering, Murphy and Nielsen.

ABSENT: Councilmen Marriott, Rouse and Talkin.

The City Clerk reported having furnished each member with a copy of proceedings of previous meeting. The minutes of Regular Meeting of January 21, 1965, were ordered approved.

The following bids were received and referred to the City Manager for a report:

SIX UNITS OF TRUCK EQUIPMENT:

	F. B. HART CO. 1441 Richards Blvd Sacramento, Calif.	BURTON MOTORS, INC. 1300 I Street Sacramento, California	INTERNATIONAL HARVESTER CO. 2445 Evergreen Avenue West Sacramento, Calif.
ITEM I:			
One (1) ½ ton pickup truck	\$1,897.92	\$1,781.99	\$1,913.60
Make	GMC	Ford	International
Model No.	I 1001	F100 Styleside	D-1100
Sales Tax	\$75.00	\$71.28	\$76.54
Total Price	\$1,973.84	\$1,853.27	\$1,990.14
ITEM II:			
One (1) ½ ton chassis & cab	\$1,711.97	\$1,571.99	\$1,713.58
Model No.	I 1001	F100 C & C	D-1100
Sales Tax (4%)	\$68.48	\$62.88	\$68.54
Less turn-in on city owned Equipment No. 2177	\$125.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
Total Price	\$1,655.45	\$1,484.87	\$1,632.12
ITEM III:			
One (1) ton chassis & cab	\$2,049.28	\$1,939.00	\$1,941.57
Model No.	I 2503	F 350 C & C	D 1300
Sales Tax	\$81.97	\$77.56	\$77.66
Total Price	\$2,131.25	\$2,016.56	\$2,019.23
ITEM IV:			
One (1) ton pickup truck	No bid	\$1,957.99	\$1,987.13
Model No.	No bid	F 350 Flaerside	D 1300
Sales tax (4%)	No bid	\$78.32	\$79.49
Less turn in on city owned Equipment No. 2200	No bid	\$50.00	\$75.00
Total price	No bid	\$1,986.31	\$1,991.62
ITEM V:			
Two (2) ton chassis & cabs	\$5,412.86	\$5,009.98	\$4,979.42
Model No.	V 3508	F 600 C & C	1600
Sales Tax (4%)	\$216.51	\$200.40	\$199.18
Total price	\$5,629.37	\$5,210.38	\$5,178.60
TOTAL PRICE (All Items)	\$11,389.91	\$12,551.39	\$12,811.71
Delivery days	30-45 days	45 days	35-70 days
Discount for cash	0	\$20.00 each 10 days	None
Bid Deposit	\$570.00 Cert. Check	\$627.57 Cert. Check	\$700.00 Cert. Check
B.F.S.S. ID. NO.	94-152.0480	94-1118795	36-1264810
ELLSWORTH HARROLD COMPANY CAPITOL CHEVROLET COMPANY ARDEN DODGE, INC.			
2201 Broadway 1300 K Street 2301 Arden Way			
Sacramento, Calif. Sacramento, Calif. Sacramento, California			
ITEM I:			
One (1) ½ ton pickup truck	\$1,848.47	\$1,811.19	\$1,855.76
Make	Ford	Chevrolet	Dodge
Model No.	F100 115"WB Styleside	C1434	D100 6114 Sweptline
Sales Tax (4%)	\$73.94	\$72.45	\$74.23
Total price	\$1,922.41	\$1,883.64	\$1,929.99
ITEM II:			
One (1) ½ ton chassis & cab	\$1,646.77	\$1,632.29	\$1,646.36
Model No.	F100 CVC 115"	C1403	D100 6 C & C
Sales Tax	\$65.87	\$65.29	\$65.85
Less turn-in on city owned Equipment No. 2177	\$150.00	\$125.00	\$50.00
Total Price	\$1,562.64	\$1,572.58	\$1,662.21
ITEM III:			
One (1) 1 ton chassis & cab	\$1,931.62	\$1,920.17	\$1,983.82
Model No.	F350. C & C	C3603	D 300 6 133 C & C.
Sales Tax	\$77.26	\$76.81	\$79.35
Total price	\$2,008.88	\$1,996.98	\$2,063.17
ITEM IV:			
One (1) ton pickup truck	\$2,037.47	\$1,972.08	\$2,113.59
Model No.	F350 Flaerside	C3604	D 300 6 133 Utiline
Sales Tax (4%)	\$81.50	\$78.88	\$84.54
Less turn-in on city owned Equipment No. 2200	\$50.00	\$60.00	\$50.00
Total Price	\$2,068.97	\$1,990.96	\$2,148.13

7233

22 SIX UNITS OF TRUCK EQUIPMENT (Continued)

ITEM V:			
Two (2) 2 ton chassis & cabs	\$5,126.44	\$5,298.54	\$5,203.40
Model No.	F600 CVC	C6503	D 500 8 175 C & C
Sales Tax (4%)	\$205.06	\$211.94	\$208.14
Total Price	\$5,331.50	\$5,510.48	\$5,411.54
TOTAL PRICE (All Items)	\$12,894.40	\$12,954.64	\$13,215.04
Delivery	45 days	40-45 days	75 to 85 days
Discount for cash	\$100.00 each unit	\$25.00 Each unit	\$10.00 each 10 days
Bid Deposit	\$650.00 Cashier's Ck.	\$650.00 Certified Ck.	\$660.75 Cashier's Ck.
B.F.S.S.ID. No.	94-1048030	94-104-2536	94-1341275

TWO (2) WATER LINE CONSTRUCTION TYPE BODIES

	UTILITY BODY COMPANY	FABCO EQUIPMENT COMPANY
	901 Gilman	1249 - 67th Street
	Berkeley, California	Oakland, California
Manufacturer	Utility Body Company	McCabe-Powers Body Co.
Catalog No. of Body	C-147-F	850
Total Price	\$5,918.08	\$7,184.00
Discount for cash	Net 30 days	Net
Installation and Delivery	90 days	* 3 to 5 days after receipt of chassis & bodies
F.O.B. Bidders Plant	Berkeley, California	Oakland, California
B.F.S.S. ID. No.	94-1208878	94-1409202
Bid Deposit	5% Bid Bond	\$360.00 Certified Checks (2)

7234

*In all probability the bodies cannot be installed during a normal working day and plans should be made to leave the vehicles for a longer period.

TWO (2) SKID MOUNTED ROTARY TYPE AIR COMPRESSORS,

	JOHN M. COLE CO.	DEWARD R. BACON CO.	LAURENCE MYERS & CO.
	1480 Industrial Way	211 No. 7th Street	801 - 73rd Avenue
	Redwood City, Calif.	Sacramento, Calif.	Oakland, Calif.
Manufacturer	Worthington	Jaeger Machine Co.	Davey Compressor Co.
Model No.	125 cfm	85 Utility	85 RPV
Price	\$5,506.00	\$6,060.00	\$5,070.00
Discount for cash	1% 10 days net 30	Net 10th Prox	1% - 10 days
Spare parts may be obtained at the following location	John M. Cole Co.	Sacramento, Oakland,	Oakland, Calif.
Guarantee period	Redwood City, Calif.	San Francisco, Calif.	801-73rd Ave.,
Delivery	90 days-Engine	Six (6) months	90 days
B.F.S.S. ID. NO.	1 year-Compressor		
Bid Deposit	28 days	45 days	45 days
	94-1504120	94-1005473	94-6090278
	\$275.30 Cert. Ck.	\$305.00 Cert. Ck.	\$255.00 Cert. Ck.
	WESTERN TRACTION COMPANY	THE RIX COMPANY, INC.	MORGAN EQUIPMENT COMPANY
	3402 Enterprise Avenue	1213 Arden Way	1755 Evans Avenue
	Hayward, California	Sacramento, Calif.	San Francisco, Calif.
Manufacturer	Worthington	Le Roi	Chicago Pneumatic
Model No.	Mono-Rotor 85 Utility	Le Roi 85 GIU	CP-85RG-1
Price	\$2,814.00 Each	\$5,577.00	\$3,093.00 each
Discount for cash	Net 30 days	1/2 of 1% 10 days	None
Spare parts may be obtained at the following location	Western Traction Co.	The Rix Co., Inc.	Morgan Equipment Co.
Guarantee Period	Sacramento, Calif.	Sacramento, Calif.	San Francisco, Calif.
Delivery	1 year	12 months from delivery	3 months
B.F.S.S. ID. NO.	28 days	20 days	30 days
Bid Deposit	94 139 8045	94 - 080 - 9560	94 1449 424
	5% Bid Bond	\$350.00 Cashier's Ck.	5% Bid Bond

7235

LOGGERS & CONTRACTORS MACHINERY CO.
903 Del Paso Boulevard
Sacramento, California

Manufacturer	Ingersoll Rand Company
Model No.	GR 85 Skid Mounted Compressor
Price	\$6,932.30
Discount for cash	1% - 10 days
Spare parts may be obtained at the following location	903 Del Paso Boulevard
Guarantee period	Sacramento, California
Delivery	Factory warranty as to defective parts
B.F.S.S.ID. NO.	25 days
Bid Deposit	93-05063
	\$346.62 Cashier's Check

WATER MAIN INSTALLATIONS: NORTH SACRAMENTO WATER PROJECT NO. 1:

	<u>TOTAL PRICE</u>	<u>BID DEPOSIT</u>
A & E PIPELINES, INC. P. O. BOX 7186 Sacramento, California	\$\$57,247.50	10% Bid Bond
CORDOVA PUMP & MFG. CO. P. O. BOX 38 Rancho Cordova, California	\$61,210.00	10% Bid Bond
LUPPEN & HAWLEY, INC. 3126 J Street Sacramento, California	\$62,413.50	10% Bid Bond
7236 D. J. HALLGREN 4465 Midas Avenue Rocklin, California	\$66,362.00	10% Bid Bond
BALDWIN CONTRACTING CO. Ninth & Yuba Streets Marysville, California	\$67,253.00	10% Bid Bond
W. O. G. PIPE LINES 3019 - 65th Street Sacramento, California	\$72,527.10	10% Bid Bond
LENTZ CONSTRUCTION CO. P. O. BOX 7538 Sacramento, California	\$78,060.22	10% Bid Bond

7237 Mr. Roy A. Green, Jr., Chairman, Chamber of Commerce Highway Committee appeared and presented the Chamber's recommendations in regard to "City Street Project Priority List for 1964-65". The report was generally discussed and ordered placed on file.

Mr. Green, then presented a copy of a proposed resolution which was favorably considered by the Chamber of Commerce supporting viaduct construction of that portion of the W - X Street Freeway between 22nd and 26th Streets, which was also placed on file.

7238 In accordance with request of Willis D. Zimmerman, President of the Alluvion Land Co., Inc., /from Planning Commission decision denying application to rezone parcel 61-A and B of Map 36, City Assessors Maps (North side of Elder Creek Road, between Ring Drive and Logan Street), (said appeal was withdrawn. appeal

7239 Report from the City Manager relative to communication of the Sacramento Women's Christian Temperance Union requesting removal of pornographic material from newsstands, television programs and motion pictures, was read and ordered placed on file.

The City Clerk was directed to forward to Mrs. Maryalice Clark, Secretary of the Sacramento Women's Christian Temperance Union, a copy of the City Attorney's opinion dated December 8, 1964, in regard to this problem.

7240 In accordance with recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Christensen moved that certain agreement with Airways International Reservation Corporation, dated November 21, 1961 covering wall space at the Sacramento Municipal Airport for a telephone panel to area hotels and motels be extended for a period to be determined by the date of cessation of air carrier operations at the Sacramento Municipal Airport. Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen.

ABSENT: Councilmen Marriott, Rouse, Talkin.

7241 Report from the City Manager dated January 21, 1965, proposing "A Downtown Development Program" was discussed at this time, whereupon Councilman Christensen moved that the report as submitted, containing among other things, the creation of a Downtown Development Program Team, headed by Planning Director Rathfon and members Mr. Al Dreyfus, Architect, and Mr. Dave Lane, Appraiser, be approved. Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

Councilman Marriott arrived at this time.

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen.

ABSENT: Councilmen Rouse and Talkin.

Councilman Murphy suggested that the City Manager give consideration to inclusion of funds in the 1965-66 budget to aid in implementing said development program.

Councilman Rouse arrived at this time.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Domich moved that the Council approve the County's execution of an agreement between the firm of Ernst and Ernst and the County of Sacramento covering the engagement of Ernst and Ernst to complete a study of the Library systems of the City and County. Seconded by Councilman Mering and carried by the following vote:

7242

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilman Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Nielsen moved that specifications for the installation of water mains the North Sacramento Water Project No. 2 at an estimated amount of \$210,000.00, be adopted and the City Clerk instructed to advertise for bids thereon to be received up to the hour of 5:00 o'clock p. m., on date of February 11, 1965. Seconded by Councilman Christensen and carried by the following vote:

7243

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilman Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Domich, moved that specifications for the improvement of Fourth, Fifth, N and O Streets in Redevelopment Project Area No. 2-A, be adopted and the City Clerk instructed to advertise for bids thereon to be received up to the hour of 5:00 o'clock p.m. on date of February 11, 1965. Seconded by Councilman Mering and carried by the following vote:

7244

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilman Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Domich moved that specifications for furnishing two 4-wheel drive front end loaders for use of the Water Distribution Division at an estimated cost of \$8,600.00, be adopted and the City Clerk instructed to advertise for bids thereon to be received up to the hour of 5:00 o'clock p. m., on date of February 11, 1965. Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

7245

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilman Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that specifications for furnishing one 7 -unit pull type gang mower for use at Haggin Oaks Golf Course to replace one 5-unit pull type gang mower at an estimated cost of \$2,500.00, be adopted and the City Clerk instructed to advertise for bids thereon to be received up to the hour of 5:00 o'clock p. m., on date of February 11, 1965. Seconded by Councilman Domich and carried by the following vote:

7246

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilman Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the Historic Landmarks Commission be authorized to prepare application and agreement for execution by the Mayor, on behalf of the City of Sacramento, to obtain Registered National Historic Landmarks status of the Old Sacramento Historic District. Seconded by Councilman Domich and carried by the following vote:

7247

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Domich, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilman Talkin.

Controller's and Treasurer's Report of Fund Cash Balances as of December 31, 1964, was received and ordered filed.

7248

Annual report of the Redevelopment Agency for the year ending December 31, 1964, was received and ordered placed file.

7249

Councilman Murphy addressed Council suggesting that the City Manager's report and recommendation "additional supervisory positions in the Police Department" scheduled for Council discussion February 4, 1965, be referred to the Civil Service Committee.

Following a brief discussion, Mayor McKinney advised Councilman Murphy that the matter would be considered by the City Council on February 4, 1965, setting as a committee of the whole.

7250 Following a discussion of the Western Pacific Railroad operations blocking vehicular traffic in the City, Mayor McKinney appointed Councilman Marriott Chairman and Councilman Nielsen as a committee to study the problem.

7251 Communication from the Sacramento Downtown Association commending the Transit Authority for services provided during the holiday shopping season, was received and ordered filed.

7252 Communication from the L and P Land and Development, Inc. relative to a 2.322 acre Greenhaven 70 Unit No. 3 Park, was received and referred to the City Manager for a report.

Councilmen Domich and Rouse absented themselves from the meeting at this time.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 483

WHEREAS, the City of Sacramento is the Capitol of California and the seat of the state government; and

WHEREAS, the Los Angeles federal district court has mandated that the legislature reapportion the California State Senate on the basis of population; and

7253 WHEREAS, this would place representation in both houses of the legislature upon a population basis, eliminating the time-honored and eminently successful federal system under which the State Senate is organized on a county or area basis; and

WHEREAS, the voters of California have on four occasions rejected constitutional amendments to reapportion the State Senate; and

WHEREAS, the State of California has prospered and developed most dramatically because of the legislative leadership provided under the present arrangements.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO:

That the Sacramento City Council does hereby petition by resolution the California State Assembly to concur in Senate Joint Resolution 2 and Senate Joint Resolution 3, Burns, requesting that the Congress of the United States propose an amendment to the federal constitution which would allow the states to elect the federal system of legislative representation if agreeable to the citizens of such states.

Seconded by Councilman Murphy and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen.

ABSENT: Domich, Rouse, Talkin.

Together with report on subject, which was ordered filed, the City Manager presented the following Ordinance, which was ordered to take its usual course:

ORDINANCE NO. _____, FOURTH SERIES

7254 AN ORDINANCE ADDING ARTICLE VI (COMMENCING WITH SECTION 47.70) TO CHAPTER 47 OF THE CITY CODE, PROHIBITING OBSTRUCTION, DESTRUCTION OR INTERFERENCE WITH WATER COURSES. (Reference is hereby made to original ordinance adopted on this date and set out in full in Ordinance Book 1965, on file in the office of the City Clerk).

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 484

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO:

That the City Manager is hereby authorized to purchase in the open market, without first advertising for bids pursuant to Section 251 of the City Charter, Well Column Materials for use in the well improvement program of the North Sacramento Water System in an amount not to exceed the sum of \$5,000.00, such course having been recommended by the City Manager.

7255 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED:

That the City Controller is authorized to pay the cost of such materials when a statement covering the same has been approved by the Water Division.

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich, Rouse, Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 485

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO:

That the Mayor and City Clerk are hereby authorized to execute on behalf of the City an Agency entitled Second Amendment to Agreement for the Construction and Installation of Site Improvements to Serve Redevelopment Project Area No. 2-A, the purpose of which is to extend the termination time of the basic Agreement.

7256

Seconded by Councilman Christensen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich, Rouse, Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 486

Resolution cancelling city taxes levied on various parcels of property acquired by the State of California. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1965, on file in the office of the City Clerk). Seconded by Councilman Christensen and carried by the following vote:

7257

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich, Rouse, Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 487

Resolution authorizing and directing the City Controller to expend the sum of \$2,575.00 out of Gas Tax 186.1 fund for the acquisition of the westerly 3.16 feet of seven (7) parcels of land located on the east side of 24th Street between 20th Avenue and 25th Avenue. (Widening 24th Street from Sutterville Bypass to Florin Road). (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1965, on file in the office of the City Clerk). Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

7258

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich, Rouse, Talkin.

Councilman Rouse returned to the meeting at this time.

Hearing on the Resolution of Intention for the construction of a street lighting system in the 63rd, 66th and 67th Avenues Street Lighting Assessment District, having been held and closed on date of January 21, 1965, and protests referred to the City Manager for a report, Councilman Nielsen moved that the protests be overruled and denied and that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION ORDERING WORK NO. 3756

Resolution ordering work which calls for bids to be received up to the hour of 5:00 o'clock p. m., on date of February 18, 1965, in the matter of the construction of a street lighting system in the 63rd, 66th and 67th Avenues Street Lighting Assessment District. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1965, on file in the office of the City Clerk). Seconded by Councilman Marriott and carried by the following vote:

7259

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 3577
ORDERING CITY ENGINEER
TO SEGREGATE AND APPORTION ASSESSMENTS

RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO:

That owners having petitioned therefore, the City Engineer is hereby ordered to segregate and apportion the following assessment, heretofore levied for the construction of a storm sewer system in Mack Road Drainage Assessment District, all in accordance with the provisions of Part 10 of Division 10 of the Streets and Highways Code (The Improvement Bond Act of 1915), and he is hereby ordered to make an Amended Assessment and Map, as provided in said Part and Division:

7260

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION OF AWARD NO. 3751

Resolution of award to Waldon Aggregates in amount of \$14,251.55 , in the matter of the improvement of Pires Tract Assessment District. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1965, on file in the office of the City Clerk). Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

7261

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION OF AWARD NO. 3753

Resolution of award to Franklin T. Gassaway & Sons, in amount of \$3,781.50, in the matter of the improvement of the alley in the Block between V and W Streets from the easterly line of 15th Street to the westerly line of 16th Streets. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1965, on file in the office of the City Clerk). Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

7262

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION OF AWARD NO. 3754

Resolution of award to W. O. G. Pipe Lines, in amount of \$20,810.00, in the matter of the construction of a water distribution system, complete, in South Sacramento Gardens Water Assessment District. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1965, on file in the office of the City Clerk). (Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

7263

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 3634
ORDERING CITY ENGINEER
TO SEGREGATE AND APPORTION ASSESSMENTS

RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SACRAMENTO:

That owners having petitioned therefore, the City Engineer is hereby ordered to segregate and apportion the following assessment, heretofore levied for the improvement of Valley Hi Units No. 1 and 2 Assessment District, all in accordance with the provisions of Part 10 of Division 10 of the Streets and Highways Code (The Improvement Bond Act of 1915), and he is hereby ordered to make an Amended Assessment and Map, as provided in said Part and Division:

7264

Amended Assessment No. 128-129-16

Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

7265

RESOLUTION EXTENDING TIME NO. 3728

Resolution extending time to Lentz Construction Company for an additional sixty (60) days, in the matter of the improvement of Southgate Park Unit No. 2 Assessment District. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1965, on file in the office of the City Clerk). Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

7265

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Talkin.

In accordance with report and recommendation of the City Manager, Councilman Mering moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 3763

Resolution approving petition and waiver No. 3763, in the matter of the improvement of the alley in the block between L Street and Capitol Avenue from the Easterly line of 24th Street to the Westerly line of 25th Street. (Reference is hereby made to original resolution adopted on this date and set out in full in Resolution Record 1965, on file in the office of the City Clerk). Seconded by Councilman Nielsen and carried by the following vote:

7266

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Talkin.

Report from the Civil Aeronautics Board regarding West Coast Airlines, Inc. application for change in service pattern, was received and referred to the City Manager.

7267

Report from the Civil Aeronautics Board regarding West Coast Airlines, Inc., application for exemption pursuant to Section 416(b) of the Federal Aviation Act, was received and referred to the City Manager.

7268

Request from the State of California for cancellation of taxes on various parcels of property, was received and referred to the City Manager for a report.

7269

Communication from Freeport Farms Development Company requesting reapportionment of assessments in South Land Park Hills Unit No. 11, was received and referred to the City Manager for a report.

7270

Communication from L and P Land and Development, Inc., requesting abandonment of road in Greenhaven Unit No. 3, was received and referred to the City Manager for a report.

7271

Communication from Shell Oil Company requesting a revocable permit for the installation of planters at the back of sidewalk and between driveways along Florin Road and 29th Street at the southeast corner of Florin Road and 29th Street, was received and referred to the City Manager for a report.

7272

Claim submitted by Nathaniel S. Colley, Attorney at Law, on behalf of John W. Martin, a minor, for alleged injuries sustained on the Argonaut School playground, in amount of \$10,000.00, was considered at this time.

7273

Councilman Nielsen moved that foregoing claim be rejected and referred to the City's insurance carrier for disposition. Seconded by Councilman Marriott and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Talkin.

Claim submitted by Daniel M. Cameron, Attorney at Law, on behalf of Lucille S. Heikkila, in amount of \$4,049.00, for injuries alleged to have been sustained due to a sidewalk fall on 28th Street, between Capitol Avenue and N Street, was considered at this time.

7274

Councilman Nielsen moved that foregoing claim be rejected and referred to the City's insurance carrier for disposition. Seconded by Councilman Marriott and carried by the following vote:

AYES: Councilmen Christensen, Marriott, McKinney, Mering, Murphy, Nielsen, Rouse.

ABSENT: Councilmen Domich and Talkin.

Council adjourned at the hour of 9:00 o'clock p. m.

APPROVED BY CITY COUNCIL ON DATE OF
February 4, 1965

James B. McKinney
MAYOR

ATTEST:

Reginald L. Bygg
CITY CLERK